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2024
ACCOUNTANCY
( Commerce )

Full Marks : 80
Pass Marks : 24

Time : 3 hours
The figures in the margin indicate full marks for the questions

ALLOTMENT OF MARKS

Q. No. 1(a—f) carries 1 mark each : 1x6= 6
Q. Nos. 2 to 5 carry 2 marks each o 2x4 = 8
Q. No§. 6 to 9 carry 3 marks each : 3x4 =12
Q. Nos. 10 to 15 carry 5 marks each ;. 5x6=30
Q. Nos. 16 to 18 carry 8 marks each : 8x3 =24
Total = 80
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1. Answer the following as directed : 1x6=6

wore AR ot sepii T i

(@) Accounting does not record quantitative events.

( State whether the statement
is True or False )

ﬁﬂwqﬁﬁwwma@wml
' ( Sfeo! % 1 wrym Sead 3w )

(b) All transactions are recorded in the Cashbook,

( Fill in the blank with
appropriate word/words )

RCl (FACTIR RS FRATE 41 27 |
(%ﬂ@ﬁm/wﬁ?ﬁz"ﬁﬁW)

(c) balance in the Passbook shows bank overdraft,

( Fill in the blank with
appropriate word /words )

AEAT ___ THG (A5 SORYITG (T |
(%WW/Wmﬁlﬁﬁﬁqw)

. assets,

( Fill in the blank with
appropriate word /words )

ST e e i 91 2 |
(@WW/Wﬁﬁﬁqw)

(d) Depreciation is charged on
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(3)

(e) Balance Sheet shows financial position.

( State whether the statement
is True or False )

eIl WG SR (7 |
( Sfech wm & orom Seay 341 )

(f) Trial Balance is the base for preparing Final Accounts.
( State whether the statement
is True or False )
Tge-fiermeia pors e eres i f¥fs =1
( it wm F wrem Soay 7941 )

. Mention any two objectives of accounting, 2

fRorereae™ R @Ie o1 Seaey Semy 3 |

. What is going-concern concept? 2

BeT Af SRR 49N T [ =2

. What is a Bank Reconciliation Statement? 2

@3 Tl figfe fo =2

. What is Suspense Account? : 2

wfore o 5 22

. Briefly explain any three qualitative characteristics of

Accounting Information. 3
2pIoraeT o[ R (@I SR gosre (AP S m
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7. Briefly explain any three limitations of GAAP.
GAAP-3 R ¢1ea foft1 TRt 55t 1< <1 |

Or / 7z

Briefly explain any three advantages of single-entry
system of accounting.

feproRR @o-2ifafd omfen R e fofior sifRar sqts amam 31 1

8. Briefly explain any three distinctions between Journal and
Ledger.

SICI S YA e 2 B e fofr wefe sy e < |
Or / 712

Briefly explain any three needs for preparing a Bank
Reconciliation Statement.

@< e Rfo 2rge F99 R (ien fofT cameamrer gt e 3 |

9, Briefly explain any three objectives of preparing a.Trial
Balance.
Tqa-Reme e 3R R e FofRb! S BILF 0 4 |

Or / 77

Briefly explain any two types of errors which do not affect
the Trial Balance.

- eofe T i G 11 g ST T

10. Briefly explain any five distinctions between Revenue
Reserve and Capital Reserve.

Sfere <% W e < e <l R Pl =51 <16 T e ey |
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v

(S)

Or / 7231

What is depreciation? Briefly explain three causes of
depreciation.

o 6 =2 S TSt S 5YeE 0 4 |

11. Briefly explain any three needs for preparing a Profit &
Loss Account.

TS F @R oo efge 91 | @ien R ecammamer gt

901

/442

‘Or/-‘ﬂ337

From the following information, prepare a Trial Balance :
woTe 7a S| 2/l bl Tge-fiEmeg oo 941 :

Particulars (f539)

Furniture
531K

Machinery
TR

Wages

T

Outstanding Salaries

| HewE TN

Interest on Bank Loan
(AP Y] 879 9

Purchases
G|
Building
-

v )

6,000
15,000
2,000
500
1,500
7,500

15,000

S
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12. Write a brief note on “Accounting is a source of

(6)

Particulars (R999)

Sundry Charges
Ry <m

Sundry Debtors
Ry o

Bad Debts

SRR 4l
Salary paid in advance

A &ATS WA

Rent received in advance
A 2f1¢ SIS

Sales

R

Bank Loan

(T 99

Discount Allowed
181 2m=

Discount Received
21 1GT

Capital
T

Drawings
RIESH

Carriage Inward

oI ECEY

information”.

s Bl BN BT 1”7 TR ¢S @bl 5 (Bl e |
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1,500

5,500

1,000

6,000

1,000

34,500

6,000

2,550

- 3,000

25,000

5,000

1,450

Briefly explain any five users of Accounting Information.

o 2 R @I e TR TR 0 <4 |

(7))

Or / 7331

13. Briefly explain five advantages of Goods and Services Tax. 5
21 SIF TIPS 1051 JRaT T W0 40 |

Or / 134T

Briefly explain the Cash Basis and Accrual Basis of

accounting.

fBp1eRFaeR Formiefe o Aiefefe st amm 41 |

14. Write the rules of Debit and Credit as per American

Approach.

IR ~l SPIR (OGS (o FERER B

Or / &1

S

From the following particulars, prepare a Purchase Book
of M/s. Bharatiya Traders :

were vyl RA9OIERT °[1, (o6 SRR Gulty T¥-32) 2% 39 ¢

2023

March 10 Purchased on credit from Bose Brothers ¢
Bose Brothers-3 */l IFT® &Y 991 27 :
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Particulars ([<39)

40 shirts @ ¥ 1,000 each
#fS¢61 1,000 5I1F 4051 576

20 sarees @ ¥ 2,000 each
2f¥c5 2,000 TF1F 20 Bt e

Less : Trade Discount @ 10%

% : @9 A8 10%
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( 8)

2023 Particulars (R<99)
March 16 Purchased on credit from Barua Brothers :

Barua Brothers-3 {1 I¢re &1 391 29 :
30 shirts @ ¥ 800 each
«f$¢81 800 Bt 3061 516
» 20 Purchased in cash from Assam Traders :
Assam Traders-9 [ 95 &¥ F91 2’9 :

50 sarees @ ¥ 2,000 each
2fg51 2,000 FF1CF S06! *fS

» 30 Purchased on credit from Gogoi Traders :

Gogoi Traders-3 *Rl I® T F91 T4 :

2 chairs @ ¥400 each
ofo5 400 HILF T4 BFI

15. On lst April, 2019, Choudhury Traders & Co. purchased a
machine for ¢1,40,000. On 1st October, 2020, it

purchased another machine for ¢20,000. It writes off

depreciation @ 10% p.a. on Diminishing Balance Method.
Accounts are closed on 31st March each year.

Prepare Machinery A/c for three years.

1 @@, 2019 wificd, G Gors ge @s-49 1,40,000 5l e iy
o7 @1 IR 1 W@, 2020 OIf¥ed, OSEIR W 95 ity

20,000 51 Jre & Ffce | =R 10% 23 TRPEA T78 omfes
Wmﬁwwﬁﬁswmwﬁﬁ@&ﬂ?ﬁwﬁwa.

i 299 A TR 2ol arge 91 |
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(9)

Or / #&

The following is the extract of a Trial Balance of Assam
Stores Co. as on 31st March, 2023 :

31 W, 2023 wiys, Assam Stores Co.-3 TFe-ReMAaT [l
wore fral fRg=e CoT OO |
Cr. (cFfe5)

Particulars (R%39) Dr. (c5Rb)
T o) T o)
Sundry Debtors 81,000 .
Ry o |
Bad Debts 900
SRR 4

Write off further Bad Debts ¥ 1,000 and create a provision
for Doubtful Debts @ 5% on Sundry Debtors.

Pass the necessary Journal Entries in the books of Assam
Stores Co.

SRS SEERTE 4 1,000 5 WF 5% TS SR@EaE 399 I %
RS I AR |

Assam Stores Co.-3 32® @& & 2R Fiis w1

16. Prepare a Single-column Cashbook : 8
G -THE TR 2T I :
2023 Particulars ([R999) )
April 1 Started business with capital 1,30,000
TG TP T8 T
» 5 Opened a Bank A/c depositing in Bank 20,000
e T AR (@&F Rt g e
» 7 Purchased goods for cash 17,000
FoM 40T T8 G 9 2
| Contd.
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( 10)
2023 | Particulars (Ra3)
April 9 Sold goods for cash
Foi% 401 @ Rew 1 27
» 10 Purchased furﬁiture fof cash -
| T 4T A R 2
» 12 Purchased goods from Ratan on credit
ToT o1 IS 7@ Rl T
» 15 Paid rent to landlord
q e Sl f 2
» 28 Paid salaries to employees
FORIIRT g f 2
Or / a1
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22,000

26,000

10,000

- 25,000

48,000

Prepare a Bank Reconciliation Statement of Ajay Barman

from the following particulars :
oo figl REFeR 91 e TR 3<e e RIfS erge 1 :

(i Bank balance as per Cashbook as on 31st March,

2023—¢ 12,000

Fre® S 31 W, 2023 RS @S W R

wifee—12,000 3

(ii) TWo cheques o
not presented to ban
2023

f 1,500 and ¥2,500 were issued but
k for payment before 31st March,

1soo%wwzsoomwmwﬁmt@ﬁw R
31 W, 2023 TR WS T 53 749 *RCNE AW @5 iRke

39 QA TR

(11)

(iij) Three cheques of ¥900, ¥800 and 1,000 .were
deposited into bank for collection but were not yet
collected

900 31, 800 %31 W=F 1,000 ¥R R F @F© Ty
t2fRe1, R Bw (o Rofm ez 731 e F1R

(iv) Bank charges debited in the Passbook but not
recorded in the Cashbook—¥% 700
cwwwmowvnwc@ﬁ%wmmamﬁ‘
TRye T @ AR

(v) Dividend collected and credited into the Passbook but
was not recorded in the Cashbook before 31st March,
2023—F 800

800 B A1 IRW TR TN (XA WF RIFS (B I (2ReA,
g 31 6, 2023 TR WS TS ARGE 741 (@I 7Z,

17. Briefly explain the meaning of any four of the following :
2x4=8
wore fraRae] R @ vk o ot i 30

(a) Financial Statement
R e

(b) Cépital Expenditure
TR 49

(c) Gross Profit
P e

(d) Bad Debt

SermRan 4l
(e) Marshalling of Assets and Liabilities

ol s T R
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Or / 731

From the following information, prepare an Analytical

Petty Cashbook for the week ending on 7th April, 2023 :

8

Tere T U] |l 7 @l 20231%%%3@@%&&
Remefeies a1 92 oge <41

2023

_April

»

»

»

»

»

/442

Farticulars ([539)

1 Balance of cash in hand with

the petty cashier
PRI (PRI Foe IF T 79 TFe

1 Paid for postage

TIFOP0 A e 274

2 Paid for carriage

*{f492eq q17 frd 2'A

3 Received from head cashier

I CPRIYPS 291 &1 <197 4

4 Paid for coolie charges

Jfera g = fran 2

4 Bought postage and stamps

TGP0 @ 9 2

4 Paid for bus fare for office peon

PRI FPree AT Aeg ol T e

5 Received from head cashier

Y3 (PRI o] 201 [ &

5 Paid for carriage

“{f4q2e [T SR 7 29

¥ )

1,000

240

210

1,800

170

230

180

800

820

(13 )

2023 Farticulars (59 ' & (o=)
April 6 Paid for taxi hire charges -for manager 770
oI T (B orwl firm 2
n 6 Paid for cleaning washroom 400
GG BIF1 $919 46 I-% o ==
» 7 Paid for printing and stationery 220

2l SIF WS TR A[% S i 2

18. From the following Trial Balance of Ashok Kumar Barua
as on 31st March, 2023 and the additional information,

prepare a Trading and Profit & Loss A/c for the year ended
31st March, 2023 and a Balance Sheet as on that date : 8
SO AR IFIR 31 W16, 2023 W4T Tge-femeg we wfefie vy
wee gl 279 1 31 W, 2023 ©IRYC BRI IZIGHE @ 99 @N
I FS- (oI 017 F TF wifive i Sge-oq ofge 39 ;

Trial Balance / Sge-fiaog

Particularsr (R 7 (59)

Purchases 1,50,000
&

Carriage Outwards 8,000
Reeie a2

Wages 7,000
TR |

Office Expenses 3,000
BRIEER Il

Opening Stock 50,000
S TGS Ay
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Particulars ([R<39) T &)

Sales 3,00,000
R
Bills Payable 10,000
LGERIN NG
Capital 1,00,000 .
PG
Discount Received 5,000
2N G
Sundry Creditors 33,000
Ry *feamm
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Particulars (R<34)
Carriage Inwards

TS AR
Coal and Gas
TS ¥ SIS
Discount

G

Salaries

m .
Machinery
TFenfS

Sundry Debtors
RRY cAmR
Cash in Hand
OO A T 4
Bad Debts
SR 94
Cash at Bank
RO G 97 4
Drawings
RIe
Furniture
IR
Buildings

g

Sales Returns

fRea @I©
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4,88,000

Particulars (ﬁa#“l) R

( 14 )
¥ o)
5,000 Purchases Returns
&Y (T
3,000 Bank Loan
A OO
2,000 Interest Received
U4 S
| 10,000
65,000
50,000
3,000
3,000
15,000
10,000
12,000
82,000
10,000

5,000

12,000

3,000

\
4,88,000

(15 )

Adjustments :
IRCITEATIR
(i) Closing Stock as on 31st March, 2023 was ¥ 65,000
31 W6, 2023 SIS ANA Tg© 9 65,000 51

(ii) Outstanding Wages was ¥ 3,000
wes W 3,000 5

(i) Depreciation to be provided on Machinery @ 20% p.a.
and on Fumniture @ 10% p.a.
TFNET €S TR 20% WIF AT $°RS TRR 10% T S
4 FfR7 =Aes

xkk

| /442
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